
ATHENS CITY COUNCIL 
WORK SESSION AGENDA 

 

Monday, July 7, 2025, 5:00pm 
 

Athens Municipal Building  
Burkett L. Witt Council Chambers 

 

 

 I. INVOCATION  
  
 II. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
  
 III. DISCUSSION 
  

(1 – 3) A. Progress Update from Lindsey Ferguson, Executive Director of the McMinn County 
Economic Development Authority, on the Mount Verd Industrial Park Site Preparation 
Project and Marketing Redfern Industrial Park 

  
(4 – 9) B. Purchase of Needed Property for the ARP Funded Stormwater Project and Approval of 

Resolution No.  2025-17 
  

(10 – 12) C. Proposal from Allen & Hoshall to Prepare Design Plans and Construction Drawings to 
Renovate the House at Regional Park for Parks & Recreation Offices 

  
(13 – 18)  D. Proposal from Gresham Smith Engineers to Design and Prepare Construction Drawings 

to Connect View Street. 
  

(19 – 25) E. Proposal from Baseline Sports Construction to Design and Install Artificial Turf on the 
Five Infields at Regional Park. 

  
(26) F. Proposal to Purchase IT Equipment and Services to Update/Refresh the City’s 

Information Technology Infrastructure 
  

(27 – 37) G. Proposal from Kimley Horn to Build Upon the Previously Prepared Downtown Master 
Plan by Preparing Schematic Designs, Developing a Pattern Book, and Refining 
Priorities/Phases. 

  
(38 – 43) H. Amending Athens City Code Title 7 (Fire Codes) & Title 12 (Building Codes) 

Public Hearing & Second Reading of Ordinance 1142 
  

(44 – 47) I. Amending Athens City Code Title 3 (Court Costs) 
First Reading of Ordinance 1143 

  
(48 – 51) J. Annexation & R-3 Zoning Request 

  
(52 – 54) K. Proposal to Add Additional Monuments at Veterans Park 

  



(55 – 56) L. School Resource Officer (SRO) Program Grant Application and Approval of 
Resolution 2025-18 

  
(57 – 61) M. Acquisition of Five New Vehicles for the Police Department from the Fleet Management 

Fund and Surplus of Asset # 4068 and 4325 
  

(62 – 66) N. Acquisition of Two Replacement Vehicles for the Public Works Department from the 
Fleet Management Fund and Surplus of Asset # 4307 and 4471 

  
 O. Councilmember Discussion Items 
 1. Mayor Eaton  

(67 – 72) i. Preliminary Design Services for Sidewalk Project from Cook Drive to 
Dennis Street from Gresham Smith 

  
 2. Councilmember Sherlin  

(73 – 76) i. Hammerhill Road sidewalks 
(77) ii. Bench Installation at Cook Drive, Veterans Park, and Ingleside Park 

(78 – 79) iii. Install Flag Poles and Veteran Flags along trail at Veterans Park  
 iv. Discussion of Charter Changes 
  
 IV. NEW BUSINESS 

  
 V. BOARDS & COMMITTEES 
  
 A. Athens Regional Planning Commission  

1. Reappointment of Sam Stephens - term expires 8/1/2025 
  
 VI. ADJOURNMENT 

 
 
 



Agenda Item 
III. A. Progress Update from Lindsey Ferguson, Executive Director of the McMinn County

Economic Development Authority, on the Mount Verd Industrial Park Site Preparation 
Project and Marketing Redfern Industrial Park 

Overview 
EDA Executive Director, Lindsey Ferguson will discuss two of the three industrial sites located 
within the city limits of Athens: the Mt. Verd Industrial Park and the Redfern Industrial Site.  

The Mt. Verd Industrial Park features approximately 200 acres of industrial-zoned land situated 
just off Interstate 75 at Exit 52. Included in the FY 2025-26 budget is $1,900,000 to complete Mt. 
Verd Industrial Park improvements using an ARC grant ($950,000), city funds ($475,000), and 
county funds ($475,000). Of those funds, $100,000 will be used to complete the engineering and 
provide construction administration and $1,800,000 for construction. This project is on bid, bid 
opening is July 31, 2025. 

The Redfern Site offers approximately 86 acres of subdividable, rail-served property, also zoned 
for industrial use and located just three miles from I-75. No funds are included in the FY 
2025-26 budget; however in November 2022 Resolution 2022-31 (attached) was approved 
authorizing the purchase of a portion of real property located on the southeastern edge of the city-
owned Redfern industrial site at the intersection of Jackson Street and Redfern Drive, off the west 
side of Parcel # 290.00 on Map 047, encompassing land of approximately 2.93 acres, from Teresa 
Louise Vincent for $58,600 to be used as the main entrance. However, that land purchase was 
never completed.  

Informational flyers for each site are attached. 

Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration. 

Affected Departments 

1



2



SITE FACTS
• 86-acre rail-served site 

(subdividable).

• Publicly Owned

• Zoned Industrial

• Environmental Phase I

• Geotechnical Study 

TRANSPORTATION:

• I-75 – 3 miles

• US 11 – 0.2 miles

• I-40 – 35.3 miles

• I-24 – 53.5 miles

• CHA Airport – 50.3 miles

• TYS Airport – 58 miles

• ATL Airport – 171 miles

• McMinn Co Airport – 7 mi.

UTILITIES:

• Substation ~10 MW at 12.47 

KV 3 Phase current 

capacity with growth 

opportunities.

• 2- and 3-inch Natural Gas 

Lines, 50 psi

• 12-inch water line.

• 8-inch sewer line.

• TVA supplier of electricity 

with 99.999% reliability

• Athens Utilities Board 

distributor of all utilities to 

the site.

TRAINING PROVIDERS:

• TN College of Applied 

Technology - 2.7 miles

• Cleveland State Community 

College - 1.8 miles

• Tennessee Wesleyan 

University - 4 miles

The Redfern Site is 

conveniently located in the 

corporate limits of the City of 

Athens, McMinn County, 

Tennessee. 

Along with the Environmental  

Phase I Assessment, this site 

also has a completed 

Geotechnical Study as well as 

a grading plan for a 200,000 

square foot building. 

The current listed price is 

$25,000 per acre, negotiable. 3



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item  
III. B. Purchase of Needed Property for the ARP Funded Stormwater Project and Approval of 

Resolution No.  2025-17 
 
Overview 
The City received a stormwater grant from the Tennessee Department of Environment & 
Conservation during 2023 to prepare an electronic inventory/data base of major city stormwater  
assets including information about asset location, material, size, elevation, and condition to 
determine overall stormwater needs. Based on the collected information, the city will construct a 
project that is needed to improve the city’s stormwater capabilities, water quality, and minimize 
streambank erosion. The project that was selected was to purchase 5.12 acres of land at the 
intersection of Ingleside Avenue and Forrest Avenue across from Ingleside Park to shape into a 
new city-controlled stormwater asset to manage stormwater from the Oostanaula Creek. Since this 
property will be a dry storage area some of the time, it will be transformed into a parklike green 
space with native plants, walking trail, stormwater education exhibits, and perhaps tie-
ins/connections with nearby Mayfield Dairy Visitor Center (concept plan is attached).   
 
The 5.12 acres is entirely within the flood zone and largely within the floodway making it severely 
limited to development. The purchase price is $135,000 based on a recent appraisal. Funds for this 
purchase as well as the entire project were budgeted in the approved FY 2025-26 Capital 
Improvement Fund budget.  
 
Attached is a memo from the Public Works Department that offers more details and how the 
property would be purchased through the Economic Development Authority to maximize grant 
funding.   
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Public Works Dept.   
 
 

 
 

4



 

PUBLIC WORKS 
 

 

TO:  Randall Dowling, City Manager 

FROM:  Kevin L. Helms, Project Manager 

Cc:  Ben Burchfield, Public Works Director 

DATE:  July 2, 2025 

SUBJECT: ARP Stormwater Grant – Property Purchase 

 

Background 
In July 2023 the city executed a grant contract with the Tennessee Department of Environment and 
Conservation for funding related to stormwater projects.  The city will receive $2,371,902.77 in grant 
funds and will be required to match these funds with $355,785.42 for a total project budget of 
$2,727,688.19.  Of this amount, $1,980,000 is for construction activities and $747,688.19 is for 
professional fees related to planning activities. 
 
The project has been progressing through several stages of development.  The most time-consuming 
component was the survey of all stormwater assets within the city system sized 24” or greater.  The 
location, material, condition, and elevation of each asset were documented and will be imported into a 
software program so that we have an accurate inventory of assets.  Once the survey was complete the 
data was utilized to perform hydraulic modeling of the system to identify solutions for problem areas 
which would be constructed using grant funds. 
 
Several factors contributed to the locations to be addressed with this funding.  The first priority was to 
determine whether a project could be constructed prior to the grant deadline of September 2026.  After 
that criterion had been established, other factors such as cost and severity were analyzed to determine 
the final list of construction activities. 
 
The single largest project selected for construction is the addition of new stormwater assets near the 
Wetlands Trail and Ingleside Park.  This facility would serve a similar purpose to the wetlands that were 
constructed several years ago, but the design and function would be slightly different.  Instead of an area 
that stays wet year-round, the new facility would be a dry storage area where a large park like greenspace 
will exist during the dry season.  The area would be nicely landscaped with native plants and potentially 
include a walking trail with stormwater education exhibits, along with an overlook at the corner of 
Ingleside Avenue and Forrest Avenue.  Connections would be available to the existing wetlands, E. G. 
Fisher Library, Ingleside Park, and the Mayfield Visitor Center. 

5



 

PUBLIC WORKS 
 
 
Water from the Oostanaula Creek will spill over into this area when the creek level rises, which will provide 
the following benefits: 

• Sediment collected in the creek will have the opportunity to settle in the dry storage lawn which 
improves water quality and reduces flooding impact by maintaining the current creek capacity 
rather than having it fill with excess sediment. 

• By diverting a portion of the water from the primary creek channel, the speed of water flow in 
the channel will be reduced which helps prevent streambank erosion. 

• By diverting a portion of the water into this area, the downstream sections of the creek will have 
a minimal reduction in the high-water level during rain events.  However, the property is not large 
enough to have a significant impact on water levels downstream but even small reductions are 
better than none. 

 
The city will utilize a portion of the grant funds to purchase the property needed to construct this facility.  
The land is currently owned by Mayfield and is bounded by Forrest Avenue, Ingleside Avenue, Mayfield 
Lane, and the Oostanaula Creek.  We have been working with Mayfield since last year on the terms of an 
agreement for the city to purchase parcel 057H D 001.00 which is 5.12 acres.  Currently, there are no 
structures on the property and its future use is severely limited by its location which is entirely within the 
flood zone and is largely within the floodway. 
 
The city recently had an appraisal conducted on the property to establish fair market value.  The appraisal 
indicated the property value to be between $99,000 and $135,000.  Based upon our estimates prior to 
obtaining the appraisal, this is within the range we anticipated.  As such, we propose using grant funds to 
purchase the parcel, which is currently owned by Mayfield, for the construction of a stormwater facility.  
I am attaching a draft sketch of what the facility will look like after construction but note that this is a draft 
and some changes may be required prior to or during construction. 
 
To maximize the benefit of the purchase for both the city and Mayfield, the transaction will be facilitated 
by the McMinn County Industrial Development Board.  The only impact to the city that the inclusion of 
the IDB has on the project is the purchase amount will be paid to the IDB rather than Mayfield and the 
deed we receive transferring ownership would also come from the IDB rather than Mayfield. 
 
Action Needed 
City council approve purchase parcel 057H D 001.00 using ARP Stormwater Grant Funds for the purpose 
of constructing a stormwater facility to improve water quality in the Oostanaula Creek. 

6



ARP Stormwater Grant 
Property Acquisition Proposal 

City of Athens – Mayfield Dairy – McMinn County EDA 
July 2025 

Project Summary – The City of Athens (City) is using ARP Grant funding to acquire property to 
construct stormwater infrastructure to improve water quality and reduce streambank erosion. 
The parcel needed for the project is currently owned by DFA Dairy Brands Fluid, LLC, d/b/a Mayfield 
Dairy (Mayfield). By facilitating the project, the McMinn County Industrial Development 
Authority (IDB) will allow the City to maximize grant funding, thus limiting the expenditure of 
local funds, and assist Mayfield with site enhancements to improve traffic flow and increase 
security. 

Mayfield Dairy will: 
• Transfer ownership of Parcel 057H D 001.00 which consists of 5.12 land unit acres
• Receive from IDB goods and services (engineering, fencing, traffic flow enhancements, 

etc.) in an amount not to exceed $135,000 which has been determined as the maximum 
value of the property by a certified appraiser

McMinn County IDB will: 
• Transfer ownership of said parcel to the city for an amount of $135,000
• Execute an agreement with Gresham Smith & Partners (GSP) as negotiated by Mayfield

for the design of improvements on Mayfield property in an amount of $27,000
• Procure and install fencing and related items as designed by GSP in an amount not to

exceed $108,000
City of Athens will: 

• Purchase said parcel from IDB in an amount of $135,000
• Construct stormwater improvements and related amenities on said parcel using ARP grant

funding according to plans developed by GSP based upon input provided by Mayfield
All Parties will: 

• Agree to cooperate with one another to seek funding for the development of an
educational trail (Trail) on said parcel as shown in the masterplan created by GSP which
focuses on dairy farming, agricultural industry, and/or stormwater management practices

• If there are excess funds after the scope of work developed by Mayfield through the
services of GSP is complete, the IDB will apply the remaining funds to the development of
the Trail project

• Depending upon the overall financial considerations of the Trail, there are options for
Mayfield to have naming rights or serve as primary sponsor of Trail if they contribute funds
toward construction using excess funds and/or other donations

• Mayfield will be consulted regarding content for the Trail if excess funds or donations are
made available for its development by Mayfield

Notes: 
• All parties are aware that the property purchase must proceed expeditiously due to the

pending grant deadline
• Any agreement reached will require the approval of the City of Athens City Council,

McMinn County IDB Board of Directors, and the appropriate representatives of Mayfield
• NON-BINDING LETTER:  This is a proposal representing an expression of interest only and

shall be nonbinding on the parties, and nothing in this proposal letter should be construed 7



as a binding offer or other obligation on any party’s part or create any rights in favor of any 
other party or any third party. This proposal letter does not address all matters upon which 
agreement must be reached in order for the transaction to be consummated.  None of the 
parties shall have any obligation with respect to the matters set forth in this proposal letter 
until such time as all parties have entered into formal written agreements with terms 
acceptable to all parties in their sole and absolute discretion. 

8



90
' C

IT
Y R

EQ
U
IR

ED
 N

ATU
R
AL 

BU
FFER

30
' T

D
EC

 B
U
FFER

30' FRONT SETBACK

3
0
' F

R
O

N
T

 S
E

T
B

A
C

K

INGLESIDE AVENUE

M
A

Y
F
IE

L
D

 L
A

N
E

F
O

R
R

E
S

T
 A

V
E

N
U

E

O
O

STANAULA C
REEK

X

X

X

X

X

E
IP

E
IP

E
IP

8
"S

A

8
"S

A

8
"S

A

8
"S

A

8
"S

A

8
"S

A

8
"S

A

8
"S

A

8"S
A

8"S
A

8"S
A

8"S
A

8"S
A

8"S
A

8"S
A

8"S
A

8"S
A

8"
S
A

8"
S
A

8"
S
A

8"
S
A

8"
S
A

8"
S
A

8"
S
A

8"
S
A

8"
S

A

8"
S
A

1
2
"W

1
2
"W

1
2
"W

12"W

12"FM
S

12"FM
S

12"FM
S

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"FMS

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

12"W

8"W

8"W

8"W

8
"W

8
"W

8
"W

8
"W

F
O

R
R

E
S
T
 A

V
E
N

U
E

T
P

T
P

M
A

G
 S

W
E

(2
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(2
)

T
A

X
 D

IS
(1

)

Q
U

E
 B

IC
(1

)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(1
)

Q
U

E
 B

IC
(1

)

M
A

G
 S

W
E

(1
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(1
)

Q
U

E
 S

H
U

(1
)

Q
U

E
 B

IC
(1

)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(1
)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

L
IQ

 S
T

Y
(1

)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(1
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(1
)

T
A

X
 D

IS
(2

)

Q
U

E
 B

IC
(1

)

L
IQ

 S
T

Y
(1

)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(1
)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(1
)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(1
)

(1
)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(1
)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(1
)

L
IQ

 S
T

Y

(1
)

T
A

X
 D

IS

(1
)

Q
U

E
 S

H
U

(1
)

M
A

G
 S

W
E

(1
)

L
IQ

 S
T

Y

(1
)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(1
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(1
)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

T
A

X
 D

IS

(1
)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(1
)

Q
U

E
 S

H
U

(1
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

TP

TP

(1
)

S
A

L
 B

L
4

(7
)

IL
E

 N
N

E

(3
)

Q
U

E
 P

A
G

(5
)

V
IB

 D
E

N

(1
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(2
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(7
)

H
Y

D
 W

IL

(1
)

L
IQ

 S
T

Y

(7
)

H
Y

D
 W

IL

(1
)

T
A

X
 D

IS

(2
)

S
A

L
 B

L
4

(3
)

B
E

T
 R

IV

(7
)

C
O

R
 A

M
O

(1
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(1
)

Q
U

E
 P

A
G

(7
)

C
L

E
 A

L
N

(2
)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(1
)

M
A

G
 S

W
E

Q
U

E
 B

IC
(2

)

IL
E

 G
L

A
(5

)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(1
)

IL
E

 N
N

E
(7

)

C
O

R
 A

M
O

(9
)

(1
)

Q
U

E
 P

A
G

IL
E

 G
L

A
(7

)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

H
Y

D
 W

IL
(9

)

C
A

L
 A

M
E

(7
)

IL
E

 G
L

A
(7

)

Q
U

E
 B

IC
(3

)

T
A

X
 D

IS
(1

)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(1
)

Q
U

E
 S

H
U

(2
)

C
A

L
 A

M
E

(7
)

(1
1

)
V

IB
 D

E
N

(1
2

)
IL

E
 N

N
E

(1
3

)
C

O
R

 A
M

O

(1
1

)
IL

E
 G

L
A

(1
)

T
A

X
 D

IS

TP

TP

IL
E

 N
N

E
(9

)

M
A

G
 S

W
E

(2
)

C
O

R
 A

M
O

(7
)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(2
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(2
)

T
A

X
 D

IS
(8

)

IL
E

 G
L

A
(1

0
)

M
A

G
 S

W
E

(1
) IL
E

 N
N

E
(5

)

C
E

P
 O

C
C

(9
)

(3
)

M
A

G
 S

W
E

(2
)

Q
U

E
 S

H
U

(1
)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

S
A

L
 B

L
4

(7
)

C
L

E
 A

L
N

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(1
)

B
E

T
 R

IV
(2

)

Q
U

E
 P

A
G

(3
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(2
)

B
E

T
 R

IV
(2

)

IL
E

 N
N

E
(7

)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(3
)

M
A

G
 S

W
E

(1
)

(1
)

Q
U

E
 P

A
G

(7
)

C
A

L
 A

M
E

(1
)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(7
)

C
L

E
 A

L
N

(1
)

S
A

L
 B

L
4

(1
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

(1
)

B
E

T
 R

IV

(1
)

T
A

X
 D

IS
(2

)
S

A
L

 B
L

4

(1
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

8"S
A

(7
)

C
L

E
 A

L
N

(1
0

)
IL

E
 N

N
E

(1
0

)
C

O
R

 A
M

O

(9
)

H
Y

D
 W

IL

(7
)

C
L

E
 A

L
N

C
E

P
 O

C
C

(9
)

B
E

T
 R

IV
(3

)

L
IQ

 S
T

Y
(1

)

IL
E

 N
N

E
(1

0
)

(7
)

C
O

R
 A

M
O

(1
)

M
A

G
 S

W
E

(2
)

C
E

R
 C

A
N

Q
U

E
 P

A
G

(3
)

C
L

E
 A

L
N

(5
)

A
C

E
 O

G
L

(1
)

P
L

A
 O

C
C

(1
)

(1
3

)
H

Y
D

 W
IL

(9
)

V
IB

 D
E

N

(1
1

)
IL

E
 N

N
E

IL
E

 G
L

A
(9

)

C
O

R
 A

M
O

(5
)

T
A

X
 D

IS
(3

)

(1
)

C
A

R
 A

M
E

(1
3

)
C

O
R

 A
M

O

(7
)

C
L

E
 A

L
N

O
O

STANAULA C
REEK(7

)
C

A
L

 A
M

E

O
O

STANAULA C
REEK (5

)
C

E
P

 O
C

C

(9
)

C
E

P
 O

C
C

(9
)

IL
E

 N
N

E

(9
)

H
Y

D
 W

IL

(1
1

)
V

IB
 D

E
N

(7
)

IL
E

 G
L

A

8
6
9

8
6
8

8
6
7

8
6
5

8
7
08

6
8

8
7
0

872
873

874

875

8
7
6

8
7
7

8
7
3

870

8
7
2

867

866 865

865

864

866

867

868

869
870

8
7
1

8
7
2

8
7
0

870

8
6
6

T
P

T
R

E
E

 P
R

O
T

E
C

T
IO

N
 F

E
N

C
E

T
U

R
F

 (
S

E
E

D
)

S
O

U
T

H
E

R
N

 S
H

O
R

T
 G

R
A

S
S

 M
E

A
D

O
W

M
IX

 B
Y

 R
O

U
N

D
S

T
O

N
E

 N
A

T
IV

E
 S

E
E

D

E
X

IS
T

IN
G

 T
R

E
E

 T
O

 B
E

 P
R

E
S

E
R

V
E

D

L
E

G
E

N
D

L
IM

IT
 O

F
 D

IS
T

U
R

B
A

N
C

E

C
O

D
E

B
O

T
A

N
IC

A
L

 N
A

M
E

C
O

M
M

O
N

 N
A

M
E

C
O

N
T

A
IN

E
R

M
IN

. 
S

IZ
E

Q
T

Y
R

E
M

A
R

K
S

T
R

E
E

S
A

C
E

 O
G

L
A

c
e
r 

ru
b
ru

m
 'O

c
to

b
e
r 

G
lo

ry
'

O
c
to

b
e
r 

G
lo

ry
 R

e
d
 M

a
p
le

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

1
0

S
T

R
O

N
G

 C
E

N
T

R
A

L
 L

E
A

D
E

R
; 
C

L
E

A
R

 6
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

B
E

T
 R

IV
B

e
tu

la
 n

ig
ra

R
iv

e
r 

B
ir
c
h

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

1
1

M
U

L
T

I-
T

R
U

N
K

, 
M

IN
 2

" 
C

A
L
 C

A
N

E
, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

C
A

R
 A

M
E

C
a
rp

in
u
s
 c

a
ro

lin
ia

n
a

A
m

e
ri
c
a
n
 H

o
rn

b
e
a
m

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

1
6

S
T

R
O

N
G

 C
E

N
T

R
A

L
 L

E
A

D
E

R
, 
C

L
E

A
R

 5
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

C
E

R
 C

A
N

C
e
rc

is
 c

a
n
a
d
e
n
s
is

E
a
s
te

rn
 R

e
d
b
u
d

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

1
3

C
L
E

A
R

 5
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

L
IQ

 S
T

Y
L
iq

u
id

a
m

b
a
r 

s
ty

ra
c
if
lu

a
S

w
e
e
t 
G

u
m

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

6
S

T
R

O
N

G
 C

E
N

T
R

A
L
 L

E
A

D
E

R
; 
C

L
E

A
R

 6
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

M
A

G
 S

W
E

M
a
g
n
o
lia

 v
ir
g
in

ia
n
a

S
w

e
e
tb

a
y
 M

a
g
n
o
lia

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

1
3

M
U

L
T

I-
T

R
U

N
K

, 
M

IN
 2

" 
C

A
L
 C

A
N

E
, 
F

U
L
L
 T

O
 B

A
S

E

P
L
A

 O
C

C
P

la
ta

n
u
s
 o

c
c
id

e
n
ta

lis
A

m
e
ri
c
a
n
 S

y
c
a
m

o
re

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

1
1

S
T

R
O

N
G

 C
E

N
T

R
A

L
 L

E
A

D
E

R
; 
C

L
E

A
R

 6
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

Q
U

E
 B

IC
Q

u
e
rc

u
s
 b

ic
o
lo

r
S

w
a
m

p
 W

h
it
e
 O

a
k

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

9
S

T
R

O
N

G
 C

E
N

T
R

A
L
 L

E
A

D
E

R
; 
C

L
E

A
R

 6
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

Q
U

E
 P

A
G

Q
u
e
rc

u
s
 p

a
g
o
d
a

C
h
e
rr

y
b
a
rk

 O
a
k

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

1
2

F
U

L
L
 T

O
 B

A
S

E
, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

Q
U

E
 S

H
U

Q
u
e
rc

u
s
 s

h
u
m

a
rd

ii
S

h
u
m

a
rd

 O
a
k

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

7
S

T
R

O
N

G
 C

E
N

T
R

A
L
 L

E
A

D
E

R
; 
C

L
E

A
R

 6
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

S
A

L
 B

L
4

S
a
lix

 n
ig

ra
B

la
c
k
 W

ill
o
w

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

7
S

T
R

O
N

G
 C

E
N

T
R

A
L
 L

E
A

D
E

R
; 
C

L
E

A
R

 6
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

T
A

X
 D

IS
T

a
x
o
d
iu

m
 d

is
ti
c
h
u
m

B
a
ld

 C
y
p
re

s
s

B
 &

 B
2
" 

c
a
l.

2
0

S
T

R
O

N
G

 C
E

N
T

R
A

L
 L

E
A

D
E

R
; 
C

L
E

A
R

 6
' T

R
U

N
K

, 
F

U
L
L
 C

A
N

O
P

Y

C
O

D
E

B
O

T
A

N
IC

A
L

 N
A

M
E

C
O

M
M

O
N

 N
A

M
E

C
O

N
T

A
IN

E
R

M
IN

. 
S

IZ
E

S
P

A
C

IN
G

Q
T

Y
R

E
M

A
R

K
S

S
H

R
U

B
S

C
A

L
 A

M
E

C
a
lli

c
a
rp

a
 a

m
e
ri
c
a
n
a

A
m

e
ri
c
a
n
 B

e
a
u
ty

b
e
rr

y
#
3

2
4
" 

h
t

6
0
" 

O
.C

.
2
8

F
U

L
L
 C

O
N

T
A

IN
E

R

C
E

P
 O

C
C

C
e
p
h
a
la

n
th

u
s
 o

c
c
id

e
n
ta

lis
B

u
tt
o
n
b
u
s
h

#
3

2
4
" 

h
t

7
2
" 

O
.C

.
3
2

F
U

L
L
 C

O
N

T
A

IN
E

R

C
L
E

 A
L
N

C
le

th
ra

 a
ln

if
o
lia

S
u
m

m
e
rs

w
e
e
t

#
3

2
4
" 

h
t

7
2
" 

O
.C

.
4
7

F
U

L
L
 C

O
N

T
A

IN
E

R

C
O

R
 A

M
O

C
o
rn

u
s
 a

m
o
m

u
m

S
ilk

y
 D

o
g
w

o
o
d

#
3

2
4
" 

h
t

7
2
" 

O
.C

.
7
1

F
U

L
L
 C

O
N

T
A

IN
E

R

H
Y

D
 W

IL
H

y
d
ra

n
g
e
a
 a

rb
o
re

s
c
e
n
s

S
m

o
o
th

 H
y
d
ra

n
g
e
a

#
3

2
4
" 

h
t

6
0
" 

O
.C

.
5
4

F
U

L
L
 C

O
N

T
A

IN
E

R

IL
E

 G
L
A

Il
e
x
 g

la
b
ra

In
k
b
e
rr

y
 H

o
lly

#
3

2
4
" 

h
t

6
0
" 

O
.C

.
5
6

F
U

L
L
 C

O
N

T
A

IN
E

R

IL
E

 N
N

E
Il
e
x
 v

e
rt

ic
ill

la
ta

W
in

te
rb

e
rr

y
#
3

2
4
" 

h
t

7
2
" 

O
.C

.
8
7

F
U

L
L
 C

O
N

T
A

IN
E

R

V
IB

 D
E

N
V

ib
u
rn

u
m

 d
e
n
ta

tu
m

 `
A

rr
o
w

w
o
o
d
`

A
rr

o
w

w
o
o
d
 V

ib
u
rn

u
m

#
3

2
4
" 

h
t

6
0
" 

O
.C

.
3
6

F
U

L
L
 C

O
N

T
A

IN
E

R

P
L
A

N
T

 S
C

H
E

D
U

L
E

0 G
R

A
P

H
IC

 S
C

A
L

E

3
0
'

3
0
'

6
0
'

N
O

R
T

H

R
e
v
is

io
n

N
o
.

D
a
te

D
e
s
c
ri
p
ti
o
n

L
2

0
0

O
V

E
R

A
L
L
 L

A
N

D
S

C
A

P
E

P
L
A

N

Mayfield Regional

Detention
Ingleside Ave

Athens, TN 37303

\\global.gsp\data\nf\kn_nf02\4676200\01Work\01CAD\06LP\Sheets\46762_L200 Landscape.dwg - Kate Choi - 6/11/2025 6:19:50 AM

T
h

is
 L

in
e

 I
s
 3

 I
n

c
h

e
s
 W

h
e

n
 P

ri
n

te
d

 F
u

ll 
S

iz
e

4
6
7
6
2
.0

0
0
6
.1

3
.2

0
2
5

2
2
2
 S

e
c
o
n
d
 A

v
e
n
u
e
 S

o
u
th

S
u
it
e
 1

4
0
0

N
a
s
h
v
ill

e
, 
T

N
  
3
7
2
0
1

6
1
5
.7

7
0
.8

1
0
0

T
H

IS
 P

L
A

N
 H

A
S

 B
E

E
N

 S
IG

N
E

D
,

S
E

A
L

E
D

, 
A

N
D

 D
A

T
E

D
 D

IG
IT

A
L

L
Y

6
/1

3
/2

0
2

5
L

A
N

D
S

C
A

P
E

 S
IT

E
 D

A
T

A

A
D

D
R

E
S

S
:

IN
G

L
E

S
ID

E
 A

V
E

Z
O

N
IN

G
:

R
-2

 M
E

D
IU

M
 D

E
N

S
IT

Y
 R

E
S

ID
E

N
T

IA
L

 D
IS

T
R

IC
T

A
C

R
E

A
G

E
:

5
.3

±
 A

C
. 

(2
3

1
,6

3
5

±
 S

F
)

S
T

R
E

E
T

 Y
A

R
D

 

IN
G

L
E

S
ID

E
 A

V
E

N
U

E
 (

6
2

0
 L

F
)

R
E

Q
U

IR
E

D
:

1
8

 (
1

 P
E

R
 3

5
 L

F
)

P
R

O
V

ID
E

D
:

1
8

M
A

Y
F

IE
L

D
 L

A
N

E
 (

2
1

1
 L

F
)

R
E

Q
U

IR
E

D
:

6
 (

1
 P

E
R

 3
5

 L
F

)

P
R

O
V

ID
E

D
:

6

F
O

R
R

E
S

T
 A

V
E

N
U

E
 (

5
2

9
 L

F
)

R
E

Q
U

IR
E

D
:

1
5

 (
1

 P
E

R
 3

5
 L

F
)

P
R

O
V

ID
E

D
:

1
5

P
A

R
K

IN
G

 L
O

T
N

/A

S
C

R
E

E
N

IN
G

N
/A

E
X

IS
T

IN
G

 T
R

E
E

T
O

 R
E

M
A

IN
 (

T
Y

P
.)

S
O

U
T

H
E

R
N

 S
H

O
R

T

G
R

A
S

S
 M

E
A

D
O

W

S
E

E
D

 M
IX

T
R

E
E

 P
R

O
T

E
C

T
IO

N

F
E

N
C

E
 (

T
Y

P
.)

S
O

U
T

H
E

R
N

 S
H

O
R

T

G
R

A
S

S
 M

E
A

D
O

W

S
E

E
D

 M
IX

S
O

U
T

H
E

R
N

 S
H

O
R

T
 G

R
A

S
S

M
E

A
D

O
W

 S
E

E
D

 M
IX

T
U

R
F

 (
S

E
E

D
)

T
U

R
F

 (
S

E
E

D
)

T
U

R
F

 (
S

E
E

D
)

T
U

R
F

 (
S

E
E

D
)

T
U

R
F

 (
S

E
E

D
)

T
U

R
F

 (
S

E
E

D
)

9



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item  
III. C. Proposal from Allen & Hoshall to Prepare Design Plans and Construction Drawings to 

Renovate the House at Regional Park for Parks & Recreation Offices 
 
Overview 
The approved FY 2025-26 Capital Improvement Fund budget contains $275,000 to renovate the 
house at Regional Park for Parks & Recreation Offices. To begin this project, design plans and 
construction drawings need to be developed. Allen & Hoshall has submitted a proposal for this 
project (attached). After the construction drawings are completed, they will be bid out, the bid 
awarded by City Council, and construction will begin. Estimated completion time is Spring 2026.  
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Parks & Recreation  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

10



11



12



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item  
III. D. Proposal from Gresham Smith Engineers to Design and Prepare Construction Drawings to 

Connect View Street.  
 
Overview 
The city recently acquired a 0.13-acre strip of land as right-of-way to connect the two sides of 
View Street in preparation of connecting and paving this city street as a through street. The 
approved FY 2025-26 Capital Improvement Fund budget contains $305,000 to design, prepare 
construction drawings, bid out, and construct this project. Gresham Smith Engineers has submitted 
a proposal for this project (attached). After the construction drawings are completed, they will be 
bid out, the bid awarded by City Council, and construction will begin. Estimated completion time 
is Spring 2026.  
 
A memo from the Public Works Department with additional details is also attached.  
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Public Works  

 

 

13



14



15



16



17



18



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
III. E. Proposal from Baseline Sports Construction to Design and Install Artificial Turf on the 

Five Infields at Regional Park.  
 
Overview 
During the 2025 Strategic Summit held during February 2025, the top project that emerged was to 
install artificial turf on the five infields at Regional Park to enhance sports tourism, attract more 
regional and state-wide sports tournaments, and increase local hotel/motel tax revenue. Based on 
that meeting, $1,500,000 was budgeted in the approved FY 2025-26 Capital Improvement Fund 
($1,300,000) and Hotel/Motel Tax Fund ($200,000) budgets for this project.  
 
The Parks & Recreation Director, Project Manager, and Purchasing Assistant met with several 
installers that are part of a cooperative purchasing agreement to obtain costs and installation 
schedules. To that end, they selected Baseline Sports Construction. to install artificial turf on the 
five infields at Regional Park. Baseline is a known company that has successfully performed 
similar work in the city and county prior. The cost of the turf installation is $1,342,815.23, the 
required bonds cost is $13,428.15, and grading design fees are $15,000. In addition to the 
installation cost, $50,000 is needed to repair a longstanding drainage problem on Field 4 for a total 
project cost of $1,421,243.38, or $78,756.62 under budget which would be used as a contingency 
to fund unforeseen items, if any. This project will start during late October 2025 at the end of the 
current softball season and be completed during early February 2026, the beginning of the 
upcoming softball season. Baseline’s proposal is attached.  
 
For additional background, Regional Park’s five baseball/softball fields are currently 70-foot bases 
which can only accommodate 8U to 14U girls’ softball, up to 12U boy’s baseball, adult softball, 
and senior adult softball along with these types of tournaments. With this project, the five fields 
will have up to 90-foot bases resulting in accommodating and attracting a larger variety of sports 
teams and tournaments including middle school baseball, high school baseball, and even college 
baseball. Additionally, since McMinn County High School and TWU’s baseball fields have 90-
foot bases, they can be included in tournament play with the city to attract even larger tournaments.  
 
When completed, this project would result in minimizing cancelled games due to weather and 
unplayable fields and less maintenance which would free up existing workers to be more 
productive with other tasks. Lastly, the Parks & Recreation Department would aggressively market 
the new and improved fields to attract as many local, regional, and state-wide tournaments as 
possible. Attached is a memo from the Public Works Department offering additional details about 
this project.  
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Parks & Recreation Department 

19



 

PUBLIC WORKS 
 

TO:  Randall Dowling, City Manager 

FROM:  Kevin L. Helms, Project Manager 

Cc:  Ben Burchfield, Public Works Director 

  Matt Siniard, Parks and Recreation Director 

DATE:  July 2, 2025 

SUBJECT: Regional Park Turf Installation 

Background 
Following discussion at the 2025 Strategic Summit in February, $1,500,000 was included in the FY26 
budget to be used for turf installation on five infields at Regional Park.  Recently, Matt Siniard and Angela 
Robbins joined me at meetings with Baseline Sports Construction and Turf of America to assess products 
and pricing for this project.  Both companies can provide turf through a purchasing cooperative.  Baseline 
has a proven track record including countless projects throughout the region.  Their work includes several 
projects with the City of Athens, Athens City Schools, and McMinn County. 
 
Once this project is complete, the five fields will have the ability to accommodate numerous base distances 
up to 90-foot. By adding this capability, the fields will be able to accommodate both softball and baseball.  
This is because field dimensions for the upper age groups in baseball require 90-foot bases. Currently there 
is no facility in this area that can host baseball games requiring 90-foot bases on more than one field 
concurrently.  Additionally, since McMinn County High School and TWU’s baseball fields have 90-foot 
bases, they could be included in tournament play with the city to attract even larger tournaments.  
 
Cost 
The cost to turf the existing infield area while also expanding them to allow for 90-foot bases is 
$1,342,815.23.  This fee includes a field groomer needed to perform regular maintenance on the turf. 
Other fees include: 

• Required Bonds - $13,428.15 
• Grading Plan Desing & Permitting - $15,000 
• Field 4 Drainage Repairs - $50,000 

 
Significant drainage issues exist in both the infield and outfield of field four.  The process of installing turf 
on the infield will rectify the drainage issues on the infield, but drainage issues in the outfield will still exist 
without additional work.  If these issues are not addressed, much of the benefit from turf installation will 
be negated on field four because standing water will remain in the outfield long after the turf infields will 
have drained sufficiently enough to resume play. 
 
 

20



 

PUBLIC WORKS 
 
 
We are requesting the balance of appropriated funds in the amount of $78,756.62 be approved as 
contingency for the project.  This represents 5/5% of the total project cost, which is well within the general 
percentage of construction allocated for project contingency.   
 
The proposal from Baseline is attached. 
 
Product Information and Installation Process 
The project will be completed in two phases.  The initial phase will begin as soon as possible and will 
address the drainage issues in the outfield of field four.  The ideal scenario is for this work to be done while 
grass is still actively growing so disturbed areas will be covered by grass before it goes dormant for the 
winter.  The remainder of the project will begin about the fourth week of October, which is immediately 
after the end of the current softball season.  Construction should be completed by the end of February so 
that the March league can begin play as normally scheduled. 
 
The turf to be utilized on the fields is TRUHOP 46 which is manufactured in Georgia by SHAW Sports 
Turf.  The color will be very similar to the color of the infield clay mix currently in use on all fields.  This 
specific product has been used at numerous facilities nationwide including: 

• Dunedin Park (Toronto Blue Jays Spring Training Facility) – Dunedin, Florida 
• Bear River Sports Complex – Loleta, Georgia 
• Cedar Stone Park – Smyrna, Tennessee 
• Riverdale High School – Murfreesboro, Tennessee 

 
A product specification sheet is attached. 
 
Action Needed 
Motion to approve awarding the Regional Park Turf Installation Project to Baseline using SHAW Sports 
Turf OMNIA Cooperative Purchasing Contract #R050422 in an amount not to exceed $1,500,000. 

21



Athens Regional Park

Prepared By Prepared For 7/1/2025

Baseline Sports Construction, LLC City of Athens, TN

Steve Clift
3600 Henson Road
Knoxville, Tennessee 37921

Kevin Helms
815 N. Jackson Street
Athens, Tennessee 37303

423.593.8284
steve@baselinellc.com

423.744.2788
khelms@athenstn.gov

Scope of Work

WE HEREBY PROPOSE THE FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS & PRICING FOR THE CONVERSION OF 5 INFIELDS +
BACKSTOP HALOS:

1) Mobilization, temporary facilities, construction dumpsters and layout

2) Construction entrances and fence removal as required

3) Excavation of existing infields and halo areas behind backstops to a depth not to exceed 8" and dump on site

4) Fine grading utilizing laser guided equipment

5) Installation of an 8" HDPE, perforated collector pipe at perimeter of field and halo areas as required including trench
fabric and wash stone including connections to existing storm drainage systems at 3 fields and discharge beyond the
outfield fence @ 2 fields

6) Installation of perimeter concrete curbing to encase existing fence posts where possible including a nailer board for turf
attachment

7) Installation of a 4-ounce filter fabric over field and halo area subgrade

8) Installation of a 12" flat panel drainpipe placed 30' OC, terminating at the top of the collector pipe trench

9) Installation of a 6" free draining stone base utilizing 4.5" of #57 stone + 1.5" of #8 stone utilizing laser guided equipment

10) Installation of the "Tru-Hop" synthetic turf system at infields and halo areas as manufactured by SHAW Sports Turf
including 2.4 pounds of sand + 1.5 pounds of ambient rubber per SF. Field markings include base lines, catcher boxes,
batter's boxes, on deck circles, and softball pitching circles

11) Installation of base anchors to accommodate 60', 65', and 70' base paths.

12) Removal of construction access drives and general site clean up

Proposal Total $1,017,983.23

Athens Regional Park - City of Athens, TN

Page 1 of 2

22

SteveClift
Typewriter
Add Alternate 1 to Convert Outfield at SW Field:                            $798,600

Add Alternate 2 to Expand Infields to Accommodate 90' Bases:  $324,832



Terms of Service

1) Assumes fence removal and replacement by City of Athens staff

2) Assumes a continuous, uninterrupted workflow and haul routes for project duration

3) Assumes adequate staging and laydown areas for project duration

4) Assumes excavated materials will be dumped on site

5) Does not allow for removal, remediation or replacement of unsuitable soils, solid rock or hazardous materials

6) Does not allow for the removal, remediation, or replacement of underground utilities. Utility location by owner

7) Does not allow for repair or replacement of parking lots, sidewalks or landscape areas damaged during construction

8) Engineering, design and permitting by others

9) Performance & payment bonds available for a 1% surcharge

10) Based on current material and labor prices and is subject to change after 30 days due to current market volatility

11) Assumes construction late summer / fall of 2025

12) Cooperative purchasing agreement is available via SHAW Sports Turf OMNIA contract # R050422 for sports surfaces

Signature
City of Athens, TN

Athens Regional Park - City of Athens, TN

Page 2 of 2

23



46

PRODUCT TESTING
Shaw Sports Turf knows that baseball is a 
purist’s game. That’s why we’ve invested 
considerable resources in developing a 
system that plays and performs just like the 
best natural grass baseball fields.

Our R&D team has tested fields at all 
levels, from recreation fields to professional 
baseball playing fields. We’ve done extensive 
research on several properties that are 
important in systems designed to be more 
like natural grass.

PRODUCT FEATURES
•	 Sand/rubber infill creates a fast,  

dense, firm surface 
•	 Combination of monofilament fiber  

and slit film fiber provide the best of  
both worlds 

•	 Reduced infill flyout and migration 
•	 Multi-layer backing provides superior 

dimensional stability and tuft bind 
•	 Better ball roll, durability and aesthetics

Designed specifically for baseball performance, 
Shaw Sports Turf set out to engineer the 
ultimate baseball field. With feedback from 
Hall of Famer John Smoltz, TruHop was created 
and is the closest thing to natural grass. Its 
revolutionary design mirrors the real thing in 
terms of playability and performance yet provides 
durability that natural grass just can’t rival. 

TRUHOP® 
46

TOTAL PRODUCT WEIGHT 
74 oz / yd2 

PILE YARN FIBER WEIGHT 
46 oz / yd2

AVERAGE PILE HEIGHT 
1.625 in / 41.28 mm

COLOR 
Multiple

24



46TRUHOP® 46

TEST UNIT SPECIFICATIONS

Linear Density - Denier* denier 9,000

Thickness** microns 110

Break Strength*** lbs / force 20

Elongation % > 30

Total Lead Content ppm < 100

Total Product Weight**** oz / yd2 74

Pile Yarn Fiber Weight** oz / yd2 46

Primary Backing Weight** oz / yd2 8

Secondary Backing Weight† oz / yd2 20

Average Pile Height** inches 1.625

Average Tuft Bind Strength lbs / force > 10

Tufting Gauge inches 1/4

Average Grab Tear Strength lbs / force > 200

Pill Flammability Pass

Infiltrometer (Drainage) in / hr > 25

Except where noted as a minimum or maximum, the above specifications are nominal.
* All values are ± 8%    ** All values are ± 5%    *** All values are ± 25%     
**** All values are ± 10%    † All values are ± 3 oz

Colors 
TRUHOP ® comes in a variety of 
colors to choose from to meet 
your needs.

The colors shown are not intended for exact 
matching purposes, please refer to actual 

sample swatches for accurate hues.

CHESTNUT

TERRA COTTA

BROWN

WHITE

TAN

FIELD GREEN

Shaw Sports Turf provides athletic turf surfaces to some of the top programs in the 
NFL, MLB and NCAA. Contact your representative to learn more about our company.

877.260.7888
www.shawsportsturf.com

© 2021 Shaw Sports Turf. All rights reserved. TRUHOP and ULTRALOC are registered trademarks of Shaw Industries Group, Inc., a Berkshire Hathaway Company. 25



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item  
III. F.  Proposal to Purchase IT Equipment and Services to Update/Refresh the City’s Information 

Technology Infrastructure 
 
Overview 
The approved FY 2025-26 Information Technology Department budget contains funds to upgrade 
and refresh the city’s information technology infrastructure due to the existing 2019 equipment 
being at the end of its useful life and the beginning of hardware failure. The new equipment that 
will be installed in the city’s data room at City Hall consists of three new servers, additional storage 
capacity and processing power, new switches, associated software and licensing, and services to 
aid staff in the equipment installation. The estimated completion time for this project is three 
months or about late September and the new equipment has a five-year lifecycle.  
 
The city will purchase this equipment ($216,349) and installation services ($21,875) for a total of 
$238,224 from Litefoot Technology, LLC based in Ooltewah, TN. This company was selected 
through a competitive process during 2023, has been the city’s designated IT contractor since that 
time, and has been used regularly for IT support and department technology initiatives.  
 
In addition, the updated purchasing policies, Section 7.0 (Standardization of Vehicles, Equipment, 
Technology, Traffic Signal Equipment, and Maintenance Agreements) allow this purchase to be 
made without competitive bidding because the IT equipment to be purchased needs to be 
compatible with all the existing IT infrastructure, standardized, and installed by people 
knowledgeable of the city’s IT systems.  
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Information Technology Department 
 
 

 
 

26



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item  
III. G.  Proposal from Kimley Horn to Build Upon the Previously Prepared Downtown Master 

Plan by Preparing Schematic Designs, Developing a Pattern Book, and Refining 
Priorities/Phases.  

 
Overview 
A downtown master plan was prepared during 2020 showing high level concepts of street/parking 
and sidewalk/pedestrian improvements, traffic calming measures, landscaping/streetscaping, way 
finding signage designs, among other design elements for the downtown area. To build upon that 
master plan from concept to actual, Kimley Horn has prepared a proposal (attached) to: 
 

• prepare schematic designs within the study area to show street widths, sidewalk widths, 
parking, pavement markings, and landscape areas including street tree locations/standards. 
 

• develop a pattern book showing standard designs, graphic examples, and manufacturers 
of sidewalk materials/brick patterns, street light poles, traffic signal arms, street signage, 
wayfinding signage, trash receptacles, benches, bike racks, pedestrian signals, and trees to 
maintain consistency throughout the downtown area. The pattern book would also have a 
typical on-street dining layout and landscape treatments for intersection corners. 
 

• prepare a phasing plan and map to align the various phases with anticipated funding.  
 
This project was included in the approved FY 2025-26 Capital Improvement Fund budget at 
$50,000. If approved, the project would be completed in about four months or during November, 
2025. During development of the schematic designs, pattern book, and phasing plan, we will obtain 
comments and feedback from numerous stakeholders such as city officials, city department heads, 
county officials, Main Street, TWU, Chamber of Commerce, downtown business owners, among 
other interested parties to ensure this project receives vital input.  
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Parks & Recreation Department and Public Works Department 
 
 

 
 

27



28



29



30



31



32



33



34



35



36



37



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item 
III. H.  Amending Athens City Code Title 7 (Fire Codes) & Title 12 (Building Codes) 

Public Hearing & Second Reading of Ordinance 1142 
An ordinance to amend the Athens City Code, Title 7 entitled "Fire Protection and 
Fireworks" and Title 12 entitled "Building and Construction” to adopt the 2021 edition 
of the International Codes for fire (IFC), building (IBC), plumbing (IPC), fuel gas 
(IFGC), mechanical (IMC), energy conservation (IECC), and existing building 
(IEBC); and create chapter 12-XI entitled “Existing Building Code”. 

 
Overview 
The purpose of this ordinance is to update the City of Athens adopted building and fire codes 
from the 2018 editions to the 2021 editions, with selected provisions from the 2024 code updates. 
The goal is to stay current with state standards, industry best practices, and improved safety and 
efficiency measures. 
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is required to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for second reading.  
 
Affected Departments 
Community Development Department & Fire Department  
 

 

38



ORDINANCE NO. 1142 
 

Page 1 of 5 
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE ATHENS CITY CODE, TITLE 7 ENTITLED "FIRE 
PROTECTION AND FIREWORKS" AND TITLE 12 ENTITLED "BUILDING AND 
CONSTRUCTION” TO ADOPT THE 2021 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL CODES 
FOR FIRE (IFC), BUILDING (IBC), PLUMBING (IPC), FUEL GAS (IFGC), MECHANICAL 
(IMC), ENERGY CONSERVATION (IECC), AND EXISTING BUILDING (IEBC); AND 
CREATE  CHAPTER 12-XI  ENTITLED “EXISTING BUILDING CODE”. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF ATHENS, TENNESSEE, 
AS FOLLOWS: 
 
SECTION 1. 

 That Chapter II of Title 7, Section 7-21 entitled "Adopted", be amended to replace the 
words and figures "International Fire Code, 2018 Edition" with "International Fire Code, 2021 
Edition" except for the following changes: 

 
1. Section 510.0 Exception 2 shall be replaced with the following: 

 
Where it is determined by the local Fire Chief in coordination with local law enforcement 
and EMS that radio coverage is not needed. 

 
2. Section 903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems shall be replaced with the following: 

 
Automatic sprinkler systems in Group R occupancies may be installed throughout in 
accordance with NFPA 13R where the Group R occupancy meets all the following 
conditions: 

 
(i) Four stories or less above grade plane. 

 
(ii) For other than Group R-2 occupancies, the floor level of the highest story is 30feet 

(9144 mm) or less above the lowest fire department vehicle access. 
 

For Group R-2 occupancies, the roof assembly is less than 45 feet (13716 
mm) above the lowest of fire department access. The height of the roof 
assembly shall be determined by measuring the distance from the lowest 
required fire vehicle access road surface adjacent to the building to the eave 
of the highest pitched roof, the intersection of the highest roof to the exterior 
wall, or the highest parapet, whichever yields the greatest distance. 
 

(iii) The floor level of the lowest story is 30 feet (9144) or less below the lowest level of 
fire department vehicle access. The number of stories of Group R occupancies 
constructed in accordance with section 510.2 and 510.4 of the International Building 
Code shall be measured from grade plane. 

 
3. Appendix L. (Requirements for Fire Fighter Air Replenishment System) shall be optional. 

 
4. For Group E occupancies in all Jurisdictions in Tennessee, local education agencies, public 

chapter schools, and non-public schools may allow classroom doors to be locked to prevent 
unwanted entry provided that the locking means meets the requirements in the NFPA (2021) 
Section 15.2.2.2.4.1. 

 
5. For college and university instructional buildings in all jurisdictions in Tennessee, college 

and university administrators may allow classroom doors to be locked to prevent unwanted 
entry provided that the locking means meets the requirements in the NFPA (2021) Section 
39.2.2.2.2. 

 
6. The requirements for flammable gas shall be those found in the International Fire code 

(IFC), 2024 edition, published by the International Code Council (ICC) and shall include 
the following: 

 
(i) For chapter 2, the definition for flammable gas shall be replaced with the definition 

found in the 2024 International Fire Code (IFC). 
 

39



ORDINANCE NO. 1142 
 

Page 2 of 5 
 

(ii) For flammable gases, table 911.1 shall be replaced with table 911.1 of the 2024 
International Fire Code (IFC). 

 
(iii) For flammable gases, table 5003.1.1(1) shall be replaced with table 5003.1.1(1) of 

the 2024 International Fire Code (IFC). 
 

(iv) For flammable gases, table 5003.1.1(3) shall be replaced with table 5003.1.1(3) of 
the 2024 International Fire Code (IFC). 

 
(v) For flammable gases, section 5003.8.3.5 shall be replaced with section 5003.8.3.5 

of the 2024 International Fire Code (IFC). 
 

(vi) For flammable gases, section 5003.11 shall be replaced with section 5003.11 of the 
2024 International Fire Code (IFC). 
 

7. Fire Apparatus Access Roads shall use Appendix D along with section 503 of the 
International Fire Code (IFC). 

 
SECTION 2. 

That Chapter I of Title 12, Section 12-1 entitled "Adopted", be amended to replace the 
words and figures "International Building Code, 2018 Edition" with "International Building 
Code, 2021 Edition," except for the following changes: 

 
1. Remove chapter 11 Accessibility. 

 
2. The requirements of section 423 Storm Shelters shall not be required. 

 
3.  Section 903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems shall be replaced with the following: 

 
Automatic sprinkler systems in Group R occupancies may be installed throughout 
in accordance with NFPA 13R where the Group R occupancy meets all the following 
conditions: 
 

(iv) Four stories or less above grade plane. 
 

(v) For other than Group R-2 occupancies, the floor level of the highest story is 30feet 
(9144 mm) or less above the lowest fire department vehicle access. 

 
For Group R-2 occupancies, the roof assembly is less than 45 feet (13716 
mm) above the lowest of fire department access. The height of the roof 
assembly shall be determined by measuring the distance from the lowest 
required fire vehicle access road surface adjacent to the building to the eave 
of the highest pitched roof, the intersection of the highest roof to the exterior 
wall, or the highest parapet, whichever yields the greatest distance. 

(vi) The floor level of the lowest story is 30 feet (9144) or less below the lowest level of 
fire department vehicle access. The number of stories of Group R occupancies 
constructed in accordance with section 510.2 and 510.4 of the International Building 
Code shall be measured from grade plane. 

 
4. For Group E occupancies in all Jurisdictions in Tennessee, local education agencies, public 

charter schools, and non-public schools may allow classroom doors to be locked to prevent 
unwanted entry provided that the locking means meets the requirements in the NFPA (2021) 
Section 15.2.2.2.4.1. 

 
5. For college and university instructional buildings in all jurisdictions in Tennessee, college 

and university administrators may allow classroom doors to be locked to prevent unwanted 
entry provided that the locking means meets the requirements in the NFPA (2021) Section 
39.2.2.2.2. 

 
6. Dwellings licensed by the Department of Human Services (DHS) as Family Home 

Daycares, shall use Appendix AM of the 2021 International Residential Code (IRC). 
 

40



ORDINANCE NO. 1142 
 

Page 3 of 5 
 

7. Where ASCE 7 – 16 is referenced seismic design or mapped ground accelerations, ASCE 7 
– 22 mapped ground accelerations may be used to determine the S1 and Ss values. 

 
8. The requirements for flammable gas shall be those found in the International Building Code 

(IBC), 2024 edition, published by the International Code Council (ICC) and shall include 
the following: 

 
(i) For chapter 2, the definition for flammable gas shall be replaced with the 

definition found in the 2024 International Building Code (IBC). 
 

(ii) For flammable gases, table 307.1(1) shall be replaced with table 307.1(1) of 
the 2024 International Building Code (IBC). 

 
(iii) For flammable gases, section 307.4 High-Hazard Group H-2 shall be 

replaced with section 307.4 High-Hazard Group H-2 of the 2024 
International Building Code (IBC). 

 
(iv) For flammable gases, section 307.5 High-Hazard Group H-3 shall be 

replaced with section 307.5 High-Hazard Group H-3 of the 2024 
International Building Code (IBC). 

 
(v) For flammable gases, section 414.2.5 shall be replaced with section 414.2.5 

of the 2024 International Building Code (IBC). 
 

(vi) For flammable gases, Table 414.5.1 shall be replaced with table 414.5.1 of 
the 2024 International Building Code (IBC). 

 
9. The Addition of Appendix B Board of appeals, with the amendment of, where referenced 

Qualifications (section  B-101.3.1) of the 2021 International Building Code, shall be 
deleted and  replaced with (section B-101.2.2 of the 2018 edition of the International 
Building Code)  (IBC) 

 
SECTION 3. 

That Chapter II of Title 12, Section 12-31 entitled "Adopted", be amended to replace the 
words and figures "International Plumbing Code, 2018 edition" with "International Plumbing 
Code, 2021 edition". 

 
SECTION 4.  

That Chapter IV of Title 12, Section 12-84 entitled "Adopted; Applicability", be 
amended to replace the words and figures "International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 edition"  

with "International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 edition". 
 
SECTION 5.  

That Chapter VII of Title 12, Section 12-188 entitled "Adopted," be amended to replace 
the words and figures "International Mechanical Code, 2018 edition" with "International 
Mechanical Code, 2021 edition" except for the following changes: 

 
1. Remove section 1109 Refrigerant Pipe Installation and replace with section 1109 

Refrigerant Pipe Installation of the 2024 International Mechanical Code (IMC). 
 
SECTION 6.  

That Chapter VIII of Title 12, Section 12-221 entitled "Adopted" be amended to 
replace the words and figures "International Energy Conservation Code, 2018 edition" with 
"International Energy Conservation Code, edition 2021," except for the following changes: 

 
1. Remove C405.11 Automatic Receptacle Control, C405.12 Energy Monitoring, and C408 

Commissioning. 
 
2. The 2006 edition shall apply to the following occupancy classification as defined by the 

International Building Code (IBC), 2021 edition: 
 

(i) Moderate-hazard factory industrial, Group F-1 

41



ORDINANCE NO. 1142 
 

Page 4 of 5 
 

 
(ii) Low-hazard factory industrial Group F-2 

 
(iii) Moderate-hazard factory industrial S-1; and 

 
(iv) Low-hazard storage, Group S-2 

 
3. For daycares licensed by DHS not located in a dwelling unit, the 2015 edition shall apply, 

except C408 System Commissioning shall be removed. 
 

SECTION 7. 
That Chapter XI of Title 12 of the Athens City Code is hereby created and shall read 

as follows: 
 
CHAPTER 12-XI  EXISTING BUILDING CODE 
 
12-300. Adopted.   
Pursuant to authority granted by T.C.A. §§ 6-54-501 through 6-54-506 and for the purpose 
of regulating the repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition to, and relocation of 
existing buildings, the International Existing Building Code, 2021 edition, as prepared and 
adopted by the International Code Council, is adopted and incorporated by reference as part 
of this Code and is hereinafter referred to as the existing building code. 
 
12-301. Modifications. 
When the building code refers to the "chief appointing authority" or the "chief 
administrator," it shall be deemed to be a reference to the city manager. 
 
12-302. Amendments.  
 
1. Remove Chapter 3 Section 306 Accessibility for existing buildings.   

 
2. Replace Section 405.2.3.3 Extent of repair for noncompliant buildings with the following:   
 
If the evaluation does not establish that the building in its pre-damaged condition complies 
with the provisions of section 405.2.3.1, then the building, including its foundation, shall be 
retrofitted to comply with the provisions of this section. The wind loads for the repair and 
retrofit design shall be those required by the building code in effect at the time of original 
construction, unless the damage was caused by wind, in which case the wind loads shall be 
in accordance with the International Building Code. The seismic loads for this retrofit shall 
be those required by the building code in effect at the time of original construction, but not 
less than the reduced seismic forces.   
 
3. Replace 405.2.4 Substantial structural damage to gravity load-carrying components, with 
the following:   
 
Gravity load-carrying components that have sustained substantial structural damage shall be 
rehabilitated to comply with the applicable provisions for dead, live, and snow loads in the 
International Building Code. Undamaged gravity load-carrying components, including 
undamaged foundation components, shall also be rehabilitated if required to comply with 
the design loads of the rehabilitation design.   
 
4. The requirements of section 303 Storm Shelters are not required. 
 
12-303.  Available in the City Manager’s Office.    

Pursuant to the requirements of the T.C.A. § 6-54-502, one copy of the building code has been 
placed on file in the city manager's office and shall be kept there for the use and inspection of the 
public.  

12-304.  Violations.     

It is unlawful for any person to violate or fail to comply with any provision of this chapter or the 
building code as herein adopted by reference and modified.  

42



ORDINANCE NO. 1142 
 

Page 5 of 5 
 

 
SECTION 8. 

Any Ordinance, Resolution, Motion or parts thereof in conflict herewith are hereby 
repealed and superseded. If any sentence, clause, phrase or paragraph of this Ordinance is 
declared to be unconstitutional by any Court of competent jurisdiction, such holding will not 
affect any other portion of this Ordinance. 

 
SECTION  9. 

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that this Ordinance shall take effect upon final passage as 
provided by law. 
    
   

FIRST READING: June 17, 2025 Passed 
PUBLIC HEARING NOTICE: June 28, 2025 Published  

DATE OF PUBLIC HEARING: July 15, 2025  
SECOND READING: July 15, 2025  

 
 
 
 
 
 
ATTEST:  LARRY EATON, Mayor 
   
   
RANDALL DOWLING, City Manager   
   
   
APPROVED AS TO FORM:   
   
   
   
CHRISTOPHER M. CALDWELL, City Attorney   

 
 
 
 
 

43



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item 
III. I.  Amending Athens City Code Title 3 (Court Costs) 

First Reading of Ordinance 1143 
An Ordinance to Amend Title 3, Chapter II of the Athens City Code, Relative to the 
Imposition of Penalties and Court Costs in Athens Municipal Court. 

 
Overview 
The Tennessee General Assembly has enacted Public Chapter No. 459, which amends 
Tennessee Code Annotated Title 16, Chapter 18 and Title 17, Chapter 3 - effective July 1, 2025. 
This legislation addresses funding for the training and continuing education of municipal court 
judges and clerks.  
The City's current ordinance (Ord. No. 1028, last amended in June 2014) sets court costs at 
$90.00, with $1.00 allocated to the state under T.C.A. § 16-18-304. In compliance with Public 
Chapter 459, a city ordinance amendment is required to update the allocation. 
 
Key Changes: 
 

• Increase the amount of municipal court costs remitted to the state treasurer for training 
purposes from $1.00 to $2.00 per case. 
 

• Increase the overall court cost from $90.00 to $120.00 to more accurately reflect 
administrative expenses. 
 

Note: Fee schedules were included in the FY 2025-26 Annual Budget packet. If approved, the attached 
Fee Schedule will replace the one passed on June 17, 2025.   
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is required to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for first reading.  
 
Affected Departments 
Police Department  
 

 

44



ORDINANCE NO. 1143 
 

Page 1 of 2 
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND TITLE 3, CHAPTER II OF THE ATHENS CITY CODE, 
RELATIVE TO THE IMPOSITION OF PENALTIES AND COURT COSTS IN      
ATHENS CITY COURT. 

WHEREAS, the Athens City Council finds it necessary and appropriate to revise the court 
costs imposed in City Court to better reflect current administrative costs and statutory obligations; 
and 

WHEREAS, the current court cost structure was last amended in June 2014 by Ordinance 
No. 1028, and the Athens City Council now deems it necessary to update said costs; and 

WHEREAS, the Tennessee General Assembly enacted Senate Bill 1089 / House Bill 748 
(2025 Public Chapter Number 459), amending Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 16-18-304(a), 
to increase the municipal court training fee from one dollar ($1.00) to two dollars ($2.00) effective 
July 1, 2025; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF ATHENS, 
TENNESSEE: 

SECTION 1. 

That Title 3, Chapter II, Section 3-26 of the Athens City Code is hereby amended by deleting the 
following in its entirety:   

3-26 Imposition Of Penalties And Costs 
 

1) All penalties and costs shall be imposed by the city judge and recorded by the court clerk 
on the city court clerk docket in open court.  
 

2) In all cases heard and determined by him, the city judge shall impose court costs in the 
amount of $90.00. From the court costs, $1.00 shall be forwarded by the court clerk to the 
state treasurer to be used by the administrative office of the courts for training and 
continuing education courses for municipal court judges and municipal court clerks 
(Reference: TCA § 16-18-304). 

 
3) Defendants who are designated to appear in court and fail to do so shall be imposed an 

additional court cost of $20.00. Additionally, the state litigation tax (Reference: TCA § 16-
18-305) is imposed and included in the $90.00 court costs.  

and substituting with the following: 

3-26 Imposition of Penalties and Costs 
 

1) All penalties and costs shall be imposed by the city judge and recorded by the court clerk 
on the city court clerk docket in open court. 
 

2) In all cases heard and determined by the city judge, the city judge shall impose court costs 
in the amount of one hundred twenty dollars ($120.00). From the court costs, two dollars 
($2.00) shall be forwarded by the court clerk to the state treasurer to be used by the 
administrative office of the courts for training and continuing education courses for 
municipal court judges and municipal court clerks in accordance with Tennessee Code 
Annotated § 16-18-304. 
 

3) Defendants who are designated to appear in court and fail to do so shall be imposed an 
additional court cost of twenty dollars ($20.00).  
 

4) A state privilege tax on litigation of thirteen dollars and seventy-five cents ($13.75) shall be 
imposed in accordance with Tennessee Code Annotated § 16-18-305(a). This tax shall be 
collected by the municipal court clerk, remitted to the State Department of Revenue, and 
included in the total court costs.  
 

45

https://athens.municipalcodeonline.com/book?type=ordinances#name=3-26_Imposition_Of_Penalties_And_Costs


ORDINANCE NO. 1143 
 

Page 2 of 2 
 

a) When a defendant pays fines and costs before appearing in court this payment is 
treated as a "cash bond." If the defendant fails to appear, the bond is forfeited. In 
such cases, instead of the standard litigation tax, a "Cash Bond Forfeiture Fee" of 
$13.75 is collected. This fee is reported separately to the Department of Revenue 
and is distinct from the litigation tax.  
 

b) If a defendant appears in court and is found guilty the standard litigation tax of 
$13.75 is imposed. This tax is collected by the court clerk and remitted to the 
Tennessee Department of Revenue. 

SECTION 2. Conflict and Repeal. 

All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance are hereby repealed to 
the extent of such conflict. 

SECTION 3. Severability.  

If any section, sentence, clause, or provision of this ordinance is held to be invalid or 
unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, the invalidity of such section, sentence, 
clause, or provision shall not affect any of the remaining parts of this ordinance. 

SECTION 4. Effective Date.  

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that this Ordinance shall become effective upon final 
passage, and as provided by law.  

    
   

FIRST READING: July 15, 2025  
PUBLIC HEARING NOTICE:   

DATE OF PUBLIC HEARING:   
SECOND READING:   

 
 
 
 
 
 
ATTEST:  LARRY EATON, Mayor 
   
   
RANDALL DOWLING, City Manager   
   
   
APPROVED AS TO FORM:   
   
   
   
CHRISTOPHER M. CALDWELL, City Attorney   

 
 
 
 
 

46



47



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item 
III. J.  Annexation & R-3 Zoning Request  
 
Overview 
The City received a notarized annexation request on June 30, 2025, for property located on Lee 
Drive, including a request for R-3 zoning designation.  
 
Attached materials include: 
 

• A subdivision plat prepared by Kimley-Horn, titled “LEE ROAD SFD,” which outlines 
a 60+ lot residential subdivision. 
 

• A GIS map displaying parcel boundaries, county line demarcation, and topographical 
features relevant to the proposed annexation area. 

 
City staff will present the draft plan of services during the July 7th work session.  

If approved, the proposed project timeline is as follows: 

Date Event 
August 4th  Planning Commission reviews Plan of Services (AMRPC Regular Meeting) 
September 2nd  Planning Commission holds public hearing and votes on R-3 zoning  

September 16th  
1st Public Hearing and reading of Annexation Ordinance, adopt Plan of 
Services, 1st reading of R-3 Zoning Ordinance. (City Council Regular 
Meeting) 

October 21st  2nd annexation reading and public hearing (City Council Regular Meeting) 
October 22nd   PUD application deadline (1:00 PM) if R-3 zoning is approved  
November 3rd  PUD preliminary plat review (AMRPC Regular Meeting) 
December 1st  Final PUD plat considered (AMRPC Regular Meeting) 

 

 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is required to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Community Development 
 

 

48



49



50



51



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item  
III. K. Proposal to Add Additional Monuments at Veterans Park 
 
Overview 
During a recent City Council meeting, staff was requested to obtain cost estimates, samples, and 
wording of additional monuments at Veterans Park, specifically, a Revolutionary War monument, 
WWI monument, and WWII monument. The Parks & Recreation Director obtained cost estimates 
and samples from Schultz Monument Company of Madison, TN, the company that constructed the 
existing monuments at the Park (samples are attached). The cost for each memorial is $6,950 
including delivery and installation for a total cost of $20,850. Fabrication and delivery time is 10-
12 weeks, or about late October 2025. Also attached is a proposed location map of where the 
monuments will be placed. This project is not budgeted.  
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Parks & Recreation  
 
 

 
 

52



53



Vietnam / Korean
USS Ware

M
ili

ta
ry

B
ra

n
ch

es

R
ev

o
lu

ti
o

n
ar

y 
W

ar
to

 b
e 

in
 li

n
e 

w
it

h
st

at
e 

fl
ag

 f
o

r
fo

u
n

d
in

g 
o

f 
N

at
io

n
&

 S
ta

te
.

W
W

I &
 W

W
II

 
w

it
h

 t
h

e 
U

S
S

 W
ar

e
d

u
e 

to
 it

s
in

vo
lv

em
en

t 
w

it
h

W
W

II

V
et

er
an

’s 
P

ar
k

C
u

rr
en

t 
M

o
n

u
m

en
ts

B
en

ch
es

N
ew

 M
o

n
u

m
en

ts

54



Agenda Item 
III. L.  School Resource Officer (SRO) Program Grant Application

Resolution 2025-18 
A Resolution Authorizing the Submission of a Grant Application with the State of 
Tennessee for Funding Through The Statewide School Resource Officer (SRO) 
Program Grant. 

Overview 
The State of Tennessee has launched the Statewide School Resource Officer (SRO) Program 
Grant to support safe learning environments in public schools across the state. This grant 
provides up to $75,000 per year, per school to fund full-time, POST-certified School Resource 
Officers (SROs) in public, charter, and alternative schools. 

This resolution authorizes the City of Athens to apply for funding for three (3) full-time SRO 
positions to serve Athens City Schools. If awarded, the grant is expected to cover 100% of the 
costs associated with these three positions—meaning no additional cost to the City. The funding 
for these positions are included in the approved FY 2025–26 Budget. 

SROs serve a vital role by: 

• Providing a law enforcement presence on school campuses

• Responding to any criminal acts on school property

• Monitoring school visitors and maintaining order

• Developing positive relationships with students, improving the overall school climate

Action to Consider 
Consensus is required to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration. 

Affected Departments 
Police Department  

55



RESOLUTION NO. 2025-18 

Page 1 of 1 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE SUBMISSION OF A GRANT APPLICATION 
WITH THE STATE OF TENNESSEE FOR FUNDING SCHOOL RESOURCE OFFICERS 
FOR ATHENS CITY SCHOOLS 

WHEREAS, the State of Tennessee has established the Statewide School Resource Officer 
(SRO) Program Grant to provide funding to local law enforcement agencies to place one full-time, 
POST-certified SRO in each K-12 public school, public charter school, and alternative school in 
Tennessee; and, 

WHEREAS,  this funding opportunity allows local law enforcement agencies to apply for 
grants not to exceed $75,000 per year, per SRO, per school for which they are responsible for 
providing SRO services; and, 

WHEREAS, the City of Athens desires to apply for such funding to enhance the safety and 
security of Athens City Schools by placing POST-certified SROs in qualifying schools, in 
partnership with local law enforcement; and, 

WHEREAS, SROs provide a crucial link between schools, law enforcement, and the broader 
community, and play an important role in maintaining safe learning environments. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF ATHENS, TENNESSEE: 

That the recitals above are true and accurate and form a part of this Resolution; and 

That meeting in regular session this 15th day of July, 2025, that the Mayor and City Manager 
are hereby authorized, empowered, and directed to submit a grant application as provided herein. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that upon award of the grant, the Mayor and City 
Manager are hereby authorized to enter into an agreement and execute all necessary documents 
for the acceptance and administration of the grant on behalf of the City of Athens.  

ON MOTION BY 

SECONDED BY  

said Resolution was approved by roll call vote on the 15th day of July, 2025. 

ATTEST: Larry Eaton, Mayor 

Randall Dowling, City Manager 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

Christopher M. Caldwell, City Attorney 

56



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item  
III. M. Acquisition of Five New Vehicles for the Police Department from the Fleet Management 

Fund and Surplus of Asset # 4068 and 4325 
 
Overview 
The approved FY 2025-26 Fleet Management Fund budget contains $400,000 for five new 
vehicles for the Police Department, one (F-150 Crew Cab 4x4) for the Detective Division and four 
(one Explorer and three Interceptors) for the Patrol Division. Attached are price quotes from Ford 
of Murfreesboro for each vehicle using state contract pricing for a total of $230,232, well below 
budget.  
 
Once the new vehicles are deployed, asset # 4068 (2013 Ford Explorer) and asset # 4325 (2016 
Ford Escape) will be declared surplus city property and sold on GovDeals.com. 
 
In addition to the vehicle prices above, about $80,000 will be needed to fully equip the new 
vehicles, which is also budgeted. The new vehicles are estimated to be deployed in early 2026. 
 
Also attached is a memo from the Police Department.  
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Police Department 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

57



 
POLICE DEPARTMENT 

 

JASON B GARREN                                                   815 NORTH JACKSON STREET 
DEPUTY CHIEF                                                       ATHENS, TENNESSEE 37303 
GARREJ@ATHENSTN.GOV                                                                                   (423) 744-2740                                   
 

MEMORANDUM 
 

To: Randall Dowling, City Manager 
From: Jason B. Garren, Deputy Chief 
July 2, 2025 
Ref: Purchasing of New Vehicles 
 
 
The Athens Police Department wishes to move forward with the purchasing of five (5) new vehicles for the 
police department. I have attached the quotes from Ford of Murfreesboro for the five vehicles that are listed 
on the State Contract.  This does not include the outfitting of the vehicles with equipment.  Four of the five 
vehicles are on site at Ford, the other would need to be ordered.  This will complete the take home car 
program, giving all officers a vehicle.  We will be removing unit 4325 and 4068 from the police department 
fleet.  4068 may transfer to Parks and Recreation. Final deployment will occur following installation of 
equipment, the timeline of which will be determined upon receipt of the pending quote (approximately 6 
months). 
 
Vehicle Purchase Details 

Detective Division:  One (1) vehicle 
Patrol Division:  Four (4) vehicles 

Vendor:  Ford of Murfreesboro 
Procurement Method:  Vehicles are listed on the State of Tennessee Contract 

Total Purchase Cost:  $230,232.00 
Funding Source: Fleet Fund - FY 2025-26 Budget (approved June 17, 2025) 

 

58



59



60



61



 
 
 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item  
III. N. Acquisition of Two Replacement Vehicles for the Public Works Department from the Fleet 

Management Fund and Surplus of Asset # 4307 
 
Overview 
The approved FY 2025-26 Fleet Management Fund budget contains $120,000 to replace two 
vehicles in the Public Works Department. One vehicle (F-350 crew cab with utility bed) for the 
Street Division and one vehicle (F-150 crew cab) for the Administration Division. Attached are 
price quotes from Ford of Murfreesboro for each vehicle using state contract pricing for a total of 
$128,705.  The overage will come from the Fleet Management Fund.  
 
Once the new vehicles are deployed, estimated to be August, 2025, asset # 4471 (2018 Ford F-150 
Pick-up Truck) and asset # 4307 (2016 Ford F-550 Dump Truck) will be declared surplus city 
property and sold on GovDeals.com.  
 
Also attached are memos from the Public Works Department offering additional details.  
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is needed to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Public Works Department 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

62



63



64



65



66



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item 
III. O. 1. i.  Mayor Eaton: Sidewalk from Cook Drive to Dennis Street  
 
Overview 
At the May 12, 2025 Work Session Mayor Eaton, requested a cost estimate to construct 
sidewalks along West Madison Avenue from Cook Drive to Dennis Street. In response, City 
staff consulted with Gresham Smith—an engineering firm with which the City has an existing 
working relationship on similar projects—to assess the area and provide a preliminary estimate. 
Gresham Smith reviewed the corridor and offered a cost estimate at no charge to the City. 
Following this initial review. The resulting proposal (attached) from Gresham Smith outlines 
the development of planning for two phases:  
 

• Phase 1 includes a sidewalk and multi-use path (MUP) from Cook Drive to Old Riceville Road 
along Madison Avenue;  
 

• Phase 2 includes a sidewalk and MUP from Old Riceville Road to Dennis Street along Rocky 
Mt. Road, and a sidewalk only section from Rocky Mt. Road to Madison Avenue along Dennis 
Street. 

 
Approval is required from City Council for execution of the proposal from Gresham Smith so 
that preliminary design services may proceed. As a reminder, this project is not included in the 
FY 2025–2026 budget, and any future funding decisions will need to be considered in 
subsequent budget cycles. 
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is required to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration. 
 
Affected Departments 
Public Works 
 

 

67



 

PUBLIC WORKS 
 

 

TO:  Randall Dowling, City Manager 

FROM:  Kevin L. Helms, Project Manager 

Cc:  Ben Burchfield, Public Works Director 

DATE:  June 27, 2025 

SUBJECT: Sidewalks from Cook Drive to Dennis Street 

 

Background 
Earlier this year the City Council requested a cost estimate to construct sidewalks along W Madison 
Avenue from Cook Drive to Dennis Street.  Having a working relationship with Gresham Smith for similar 
projects, staff contacted them to request this information.  The firm reviewed the area with staff and 
provided a cost estimate without charging the city for this service and a copy of that estimate is attached 
to this memo. 
 
Following this, staff were asked to get a professional services agreement from the firm for the provision 
of preliminary design services. The agreement calls for the following services to be provided: 

• Develop preliminary plans which are defined as completing 30% of the design needed to construct 
a project 

• Determining the preferred alignment for a sidewalk or shared use path 
• Adjusting slopes to reduce project impacts 
• Plan production 
• Project Management 
• Providing a more precise construction estimate based upon the above items for a sidewalk or 

shared use path 
 
Action Needed 
Motion by the City Council approving execution of the proposal from Gresham Smith for preliminary 
design services related to this sidewalk project. 
 
 
 
 

68



69



70



71



lJ
b 

I 
IM

P
L

E
M

E
N

T
A

T
IO

N
 

P
ed

es
tr

ia
n

 P
ro

je
ct

s 

P
R

IO
R

IT
Y

 •
 In

te
rs

ec
ti

o
n

s 

• 
H

ig
h 

Ii
) 

M
ed

iu
m

 

0 
Lo

w
 

P
R

IO
R

IT
Y

 -
C

o
rr

id
o

rs
 

-
H

ig
h 

r=
••

 M
ed

iu
m

 

"
Lo

w
 

,..,
>' 

,_o
 

¢
0

 

~
o

 

4>
"0

 

~
~

T
<

 

<,,
,'-0

 

0 
0 

0
5

 

F
ig

u
re

 6
.2

: 
P

ri
o

ri
ty

 p
e

d
e

st
ri

a
n

 a
nd

 i
n

te
rs

e
ct

io
n

 p
ro

je
ct

s
. 

6
0

 
A

TH
E

I\J
S

 B
IK

E
 &

 P
E

D
E

S
T

R
IA

N
 M

A
S

T
E

R
 P

L
A

N
 

\I ~, 

\ 
I 

H
w

y
. 3

9
 

I 

l 
1,1

11
0 
I 

I I
D

 
I P

R
O

JE
C

T 
N

A
M

E
 F

ro
m

/ T
o 

I L
E

N
G

T
H

 
R

E
C

O
M

M
E

N
D

E
D

 

(M
il

es
) 

FA
C

IL
IT

Y
 

11
 
I O

os
ta

nu
la

 C
re

ek
 T

ra
il 

F
ro

m
 S

 W
h

ite
 S

t t
o

 J
ac

ks
on

 S
t 

I 
0.

95
 

G
re

e
n

w
a

y 

19
 

C
on

gr
es

s-
D

ec
at

ur
 C

on
ne

ct
or

 F
ro

m
 C

on
gr

es
s 

P
kw

y 
to

 
I 

0.
84

 
I 

G
re

e
n

w
a

y 
D

en
ni

s 
S

t 
I 

9 
E

ur
ek

a 
Tr

ai
l E

xt
en

si
on

 S
O

U
TH

W
E

S
T 

F
ro

m
 S

la
ck

 R
d 

to
 

I 
0.

59
 

I 
th

e
 E

ur
ek

a 
T

ra
il 

G
re

e
n

w
a

y 

5
5

1
 M

ad
is

on
 A

ve
nu

e 
F

ro
m

 B
lo

u
n

t S
t t

o
 G

ui
/le

 S
t 

I 
0.

17
 

I S
id

ew
al

k 
(B

ot
h 

si
de

s)
 

8 
E

ur
ek

a 
Tr

ai
l E

xt
en

si
on

 W
ES

T 
F

ro
m

 I
ng

le
si

de
 A

ve
 t

o
 t

h
e

 
I 

1 
29

 
I 

G
re

e
n

w
a

y 
E

ur
ek

a 
T

ra
il 

1
0

 
I P

ar
ks

 C
on

ne
ct

or
 F

ro
m

 V
et

er
an

's
 M

e
m

o
ri

a
l P

ar
k 

to
 K

no
x 

1.
20

 
G

re
e

n
w

a
y 

P
ar

k 

26
 
I M

ad
is

on
 A

ve
nu

e 
F

ro
m

 t
h

e
 E

ur
ek

a 
T

ra
il 

to
 T

el
lic

o 
A

ve
 

0.
27

 
S

id
ep

at
h 

(O
ne

 s
id

e)
 

7 
N

or
th

si
de

 G
re

en
w

ay
 F

ro
m

 J
ac

ks
on

 S
t t

o
 In

gl
es

id
e 

A
ve

 
1.

33
 

G
re

e
n

w
a

y 

48
 

H
am

m
er

h
ill

 R
oa

d 
F

ro
m

 T
el

lic
o 

A
ve

 t
o

 I
ng

le
si

de
 A

ve
 

1.
13

 
S

id
ew

al
k 

(O
ne

 s
id

e)
 

28
 

D
o

w
n

to
w

n
 S

id
ew

al
ks

 V
ar

io
us

 S
tr

ee
ts

 
1.

42
 

S
id

ew
al

k 
(V

ar
ie

s)
 

I 
27

 
G

re
en

 S
tr

ee
t 

F
ro

m
 J

ac
ks

on
 S

t t
o

 M
a

d
is

o
n

 A
ve

 
0

.1
6 

S
id

e
p

a
th

 (
O

ne
 s

id
e)

 

5 
Ja

ck
so

n 
S

tr
ee

t 
F

ro
m

 W
h

ite
 S

t t
o

 S
til

es
 S

t 
0.

44
 

S
id

ep
at

h 
(O

ne
 s

id
e)

 

4 
C

oo
k 

D
riv

e 
F

ro
m

 F
ry

e 
S

t 
to

 J
ac

ks
on

 S
t 

0.
72

 
S

id
e

p
a

th
 (

O
ne

 s
id

e)
 

I 
29

 
D

ec
at

ur
 P

ik
e 

F
ro

m
 C

on
gr

es
s 

P
kw

y 
to

 M
a

p
le

 S
t 

0.
55

 
S

id
ep

at
h 

(O
ne

 s
id

e)
 

40
 

D
ec

at
ur

 P
ik

e 
F

ro
m

 S
ul

lin
s 

R
d 

to
 C

on
gr

es
s 

P
kw

y 
0.

78
 

S
id

ew
al

k 
(O

ne
 s

id
e)

 

1 
15

 
D

en
ni

s 
S

tr
ee

t F
ro

m
 M

a
d

is
o

n
 A

ve
 t

o
 C

on
gr

es
s 

P
kw

y 

I 
0.

63
 

S
id

e
w

a
lk

 (
O

ne
 s

id
e)

 

14
 

D
en

ni
s 

S
tr

ee
t F

ro
m

 R
oc

ky
 M

o
u

n
t 

R
d 

to
 C

on
gr

es
s 

P
kw

y 
0.

44
 

S
id

e
p

a
th

 (
O

ne
 s

id
e)

 

7 
I C

on
gr

es
s 

P
ar

kw
ay

 F
ro

m
 R

oc
ky

 M
o

u
n

t 
R

d 
to

 C
le

a
rw

a
te

r 

l 
R

d 
2.

66
 

S
id

ew
al

k 
(O

ne
 s

id
e)

 

1
3

 
I R

oc
ky

 M
o

u
n

t 
R

oa
d 

F
ro

m
 D

en
ni

s 
S

t 
to

 O
ld

 R
ic

ev
ill

e 
R

d 
0.

56
 

S
id

ew
al

k 
(O

ne
 s

id
e)

 

16
 

I C
on

gr
es

s 
P

ar
kw

ay
 F

ro
m

 R
oc

ky
 M

o
u

n
t 

R
d 

to
 In

gl
es

id
e 

3.
82

 
S

id
ep

at
h 

(O
ne

 s
id

e)
 

A
ve

 

T
a

b
le

 6
.3

: 
H

ig
h

-p
ri

o
ri

ty
 p

i'd
c
s
tr

ia
n

 p
ro

je
c
ts

 

72



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item 
III. O. 2. i.  Councilmember Sherlin: Hammerhill Road Sidewalk 
 
Overview 
The Hammerhill Road Sidewalk Project proposes the construction of approximately 2,200 linear 
feet of new sidewalk along Tellico Avenue, extending to Towanda Trail. The conceptual design 
includes a 5-foot-wide sidewalk without a grass buffer, with driveway crossings assumed at 12 
feet wide (for 16 total driveways). The project is scoped for concrete sidewalk installation with 
curb ramps, driveway tie-ins, earthwork and drainage, and erosion prevention/sediment control 
measures. The total probable construction cost is estimated at $370,722, based on TDOT 2024 
average unit pricing and includes a 20% contingency. However, it is critical to note that this 
estimate excludes costs for surveys, right-of-way (ROW) acquisition, engineering design, or 
utility relocation. When accounting for these omitted services and unknowns, the total estimated 
project cost is projected closer to $500,000 
 
The project area falls within the City’s 2023 Athens Bike & Pedestrian Master Plan, which 
identifies it as part of a broader network of pedestrian improvement priorities. A project map is 
included (page 4 of the document), showing the proposed sidewalk alignment through a 
residential area with several intersecting neighborhood streets. 
 
At this time, the project has not been funded or scheduled, and there is no allocation for this 
work in the FY 2025–26 budget. Future phases would require funding for design, ROW 
coordination, and construction oversight. 
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is required to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration. 
 
Affected Departments 
Public Works 
 

 

73



74



75



76



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item 
III. O. 2. ii.  Councilmember Sherlin: “Approve installing benches back along Cook Drive, 

installing benches along trail at Veterans Park, installing benches along 
sidewalk at Ingleside Park.” 

 
Overview 
Councilmember Sherlin has requested that the Council consider the installation of benches at 
the following public locations: 

• Cook Drive 
• Veterans Park 
• Ingleside Park 

 
The proposed benches are priced at $688 each. A photo of the bench style that was installed in 
the downtown area is shown below for Council’s review. 
 
This item is being brought forward for Council discussion and potential action regarding 
placement, number of benches, cost estimates, and appropriate funding sources. 
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is required to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Parks and Recreation Department 
 

 

 

77



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
Agenda Item 
III. O. 2. iii.  Councilmember Sherlin: “Install Flag Poles and Veteran Flags along trail at 

Veterans Park that was approved by the Council more than a year ago.” 
 
Overview 
Councilmember Sherlin requested discussion regarding the installation of poles for the veteran 
banners. This matter was previously reviewed during the October 9, 2023 Work Session and 
was formally approved by City Council at the October 17, 2023 Regular Session (Minutes 
attached). However, despite the approval, the installation was ultimately not carried out due to 
significant controversy surrounding the project. This discussion is intended to revisit the issue 
and consider potential next steps. 
 
Action to Consider 
Consensus is required to move this item to the July 15, 2025 regular session for consideration.  
 
Affected Departments 
Parks and Recreation Department 
 

 

 

78



 
October 17th , 2023  
Page 2 of 5 
 

 
- 3 - 

REQUESTS FROM CITIZENS 
 
Approximately 3 individuals addressed the Council regarding love for others, body cameras and 
for helping clean infested areas.  
 

- 4- 
CONSENT AGENDA 

 
Mayor Sherlin advised the recording clerk to read the following items into the record: 
 
CONSENT AGENDA        

a) Approve surplus items for City and school portable building at Ingleside. 
b) Approve all furniture and equipment at Ingleside, North city, and Westside schools as 

Surplus property. 
c) Approve Cellebrite Sale Source Renewal. 
d) Approve street lighting at exit 49, as proposed by Athens Utilities Board. 
e) Approve Athens City School Budget Amendment #1 for FY24 
f) Approve Veteran Banners at Veterans Park 
g) Appoint Lisa Blos-Johnson to Recreation Advisory Board.  
h) Approve revision to the members of the Council Advisory Committee to delete the TWU 

study body representative as a member of this committee. 

Vice Mayor Eaton made an amendment to review Item D on consent agenda to approve street 
lighting at Exit 49 as proposed by Athens Utility  

Council Member Eaton amended Item D, Council Member Pelley seconded, to approve street 
lighting at Exit 52 as proposed by Athens Utilities Board  

Roll call vote: 
 
AYES: Curtis, Witt-McMahan, Pelley, Eaton, Sherlin. 
Nays: None 
 

Council Member Pelley moved, Vice Mayor Eaton seconded, that the Consent Agenda as stated 
above be approved.  
 
Roll call vote: 
 

AYES:  Curtis, Witt-McMahan, Pelley, Eaton, Sherlin. 
NAYS:  None 

 
 
 
 

79


	III. A. Redfern Flyer.pdf
	Slide Number 1
	Slide Number 2
	Slide Number 3
	Slide Number 4
	Slide Number 5
	Slide Number 6
	Slide Number 7
	Project Helios_Redfern_Athens, McMinn County, TN.pdf
	ESA Phase 1 Executive Summary.pdf
	EPSON161
	EPSON162
	EPSON163
	EPSON164
	EPSON165
	EPSON166

	Blank Page
	project Helios usb add.pdf
	Slide Number 1
	Slide Number 2
	Slide Number 3
	Slide Number 4
	Slide Number 5
	Slide Number 6
	Slide Number 7
	Slide Number 8
	Slide Number 9
	Slide Number 10
	Slide Number 11
	Slide Number 12
	Slide Number 13
	Slide Number 14



	ADP345C.tmp
	SECTION 1.
	SECTION 2. Conflict and Repeal.
	All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.
	SECTION 3. Severability.
	If any section, sentence, clause, or provision of this ordinance is held to be invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, the invalidity of such section, sentence, clause, or provision shall not affect any of the remaining par...

	III. I. Annex & Zoning Timeline.pdf
	Key Milestones:
	Other Key Actions:
	Summary
	This annexation and zoning effort involves a multi-agency and multi-step compliance effort under TCA and local code. All the deadlines, meetings, and publication requirements are meticulously tracked for legal and procedural compliance.
	Plat Map & Design
	GIS Map Screenshot
	Blank Page

	III. K. Property Purchase Terms.pdf
	Mayﬁeld Dairy will:
	McMinn County IDB will:
	City of Athens will:
	All Parties will:
	Notes:

	ADPD21D.tmp
	SECTION 1.
	SECTION 2. Conflict and Repeal.
	All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with this ordinance are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.
	SECTION 3. Severability.
	If any section, sentence, clause, or provision of this ordinance is held to be invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, the invalidity of such section, sentence, clause, or provision shall not affect any of the remaining par...

	III. K. 3 Property Purchase Terms.pdf
	Mayﬁeld Dairy will:
	McMinn County IDB will:
	City of Athens will:
	All Parties will:
	Notes:

	III. O. 1. i. Athens_Dennis_Cook_Sidewalk_OPC.pdf
	Sheet1

	ADP536.tmp
	ATHENS CITY COUNCIL
	MINUTES OF MEETING
	October 17, 2023
	APPROVAL OF MINUTES


	ADP9A6F.tmp
	Monday, July 7, 2025, 5:00pm
	Athens Municipal Building
	Burkett L. Witt Council Chambers

	III. B. 3 Property Purchase Terms.pdf
	Mayﬁeld Dairy will:
	McMinn County IDB will:
	City of Athens will:
	All Parties will:
	Notes:

	ADP1280.tmp
	Monday, July 7, 2025, 5:00pm
	Athens Municipal Building
	Burkett L. Witt Council Chambers




